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Maple Sap Reverse Osmosis
Easy Installation & Operation - FREE Shipping

Order Today - Get your RO in 2 weeks
HP2500 - $3955 - Process 150-200GPH
HP5000 - $4955 - Process 300-350GPH
HP7500 - $5955 - Process 450-500GPH

(614) 833-5120 ~ M-F 8am-5pm

Organizations grow and develop 
like children, animals or plants. 
Understanding organizational 

growth can help make sense of what is 
happening in maple producer organi-
zations. The common maxim about vol-
unteer groups is that 10% of the people 
do 90% of the work. Is that happening 
in your group? Is your association com-
posed of worker bees or socialites or 
some combination of members filling 
various roles? Is the association work-
ing efficiently and effectively?

Organizational experts describe 
three or more stages of growth for most 
organizations. Most agree that there is 
a first, beginning or start-up stage that 
leads to a juvenile or growth stage, and 
eventually to a relatively stable mature 
stage. In any organization run with 
volunteers, like most maple producer 
organizations, members are likely to be 
at different developmental stages de-
pending on the length of time they have 
participated in the group. This can cre-
ate stressful situations if members are 
unaware that this is natural. One com-

mon factor at any stage is a member’s 
desire for meaningful involvement and 
recognition.

At the beginning stages of many ma-
ple organizations, there may be only a 
few passionate people developing the 
vision of the organization and perform-
ing the tasks required to move the idea 
from concept to establishment. The or-
ganizers serve as both the members and 
the worker/leaders of the association. 
Because the immediate needs are obvi-
ous there is little need or time for long 
range planning and most activities are 
reactive rather than proactive.

As groups develop and move into 
an intermediate stage of development, 
they need more clarity and consensus 
building about both member and lead-
er roles especially as they acquire more 
people. At this stage, association lead-
ers may begin to feel burnout or may be 
unwilling to make changes especially if 
they feel they are experiencing success 
on behalf of their producers. They may 
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not realize that they have outgrown 
their initial organizational framework 
and need to move toward a new orga-
nizational model. Association leader-
ship and fundraising issues may arise 
as well as a need for longer range or 
strategic planning to guide producers’ 
organizations. Most people have been 
or are involved in a number of work or 
volunteer organizations and may rec-
ognize some of these stages.

During an intermediate develop-
mental stage there is an opportunity for 
growth or decline or sometimes both 
growth and decline at the same time. 
This period of change can be stress-
ful as the maple association provides 
services to its members and the pub-
lic, addresses governance issues, fun-
draises, provides financial oversight, 
and conducts strategic planning. It is 
during this phase of development that 
an organization may shift from being 
only a programming organization to 
adding policy and fundraising tasks, 
requiring an official board of directors 
and possibly paid staff. This may result 
in people leaving an association if they 
feel their talents do not fit well with 
policy issues and fundraising. Reten-
tion of a wide range of talent is more 
likely if the maple association’s mem-
bers and board of directors understand 
that service to the group requires both 
policy management and programming 
in order to be successful. The successful 
maple producer association will offer a 
range of policy, service and program-
ming opportunities that complements 
its mission and makes the most of its 
members’ various talents. 

When an association reaches a ma-
ture stage, members and leaders have 
clear and established roles and item-
ized responsibilities. A clear mission 

has been established, high quality pro-
grams and a positive public reputation 
are developed, and leaders and mem-
bers hold each other accountable for 
agreed upon responsibilities. Systems 
are in place to both grow the organi-
zation and maintain and support the 
existing parts of the organization. Has 
your maple association reached this 
point?

At each stage of development orga-
nizations are as effective as the collec-
tive experience level and awareness of 
the members. Producer association de-
velopment is messy and time consum-
ing and few associations develop in a 
straight line. Every organization must 
be aware of and meet the challenges 
of growing and maintaining its pro-
grams while also remaining relevant to 
its members. They must meet the chal-
lenge of developing the board of direc-
tors, volunteers, paid staff, and the fi-
nancing they need to be successful. 

How does an organization find out 
where it is and where its members are? 
Michael Burns of BWB Solutions sug-
gests a five-step process for finding an 
organization’s place(s). The first step 
is to take stock of both tangible and 
intangible assets. Tangible assets are 
finances, equipment and members. In-
tangible assets include reputation and 
support from non-member community 
leaders. The second step is to assess lo-
cal, regional, national and international 
external circumstances that impact the 
association’s growth. The third step is 
to identify internal needs and activities 
by cataloguing time spent on different 
tasks and prioritizing who is responsi-
ble for what tasks and which tasks have 
priority. The fourth step is to identify 
where needs are not being met between 
programs and projects, policies and 
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actual practices, budgets and actual 
expenses. The fifth step is to assemble 
the information and then take action on 
what has been discovered. Reviewing 
the information can show where the or-
ganization needs to move forward, step 
backward or reorganize. 

Understanding growth stages will 
help to understand how the organiza-
tion commits to its mission and how 
the important work of the organization 
is conducted especially when things 
don’t go smoothly. Different parts of 
the organization may be in different 
phases of organizational development 
as they work through different proj-
ects. Understanding this strengthens 
and empowers the directors and mem-
bers of any group to move in a positive 
direction and achieve the mission to 
which the organization is committed. 

For a checklist of how your organiza-
tion is working, see the example created 
by the Greater Twin Cities United Way 
located here: http://bit.ly/1LNWdux It 
can be completed online if you want to 
submit your name to a business compa-
ny or the sections can be printed off for 
your use. Not every item on the check-
list is relevant to maple producer as-
sociations but most of the sections will 
help show the strengths of and the op-
portunities for your maple association. 
Reviewing this checklist should gener-
ate useful discussions for your asso-
ciation and should streamline its work 
and possibly lighten the load.
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